PUBLIC SERVICE BOARD-EL PASO WATER UTILITIES
TABULATION OF BIDS FOR: HYDROGEN CHLORIDE
BID OPENING: April 7, 2022 at 11:00 AM

BID NUMBER: 56-22
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Previous Bid
01/23/2020 SYOXSA, INC. UNIVAR USA, INC.
6996 Commerce Ave. 8201 S. 212th]
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY _ El Paso, TX 79915 Kent, WA 98032
1. HYDROGEN CHLORIDE 8 UNIT $ 8,437.50] $ 10,000.00
TECHNICAL SIZE Y 600 LB CYL ITEM 1 TOTAL $ 67,500.00] $ 80,000.00 NO BID
CYLINDER
2 HYDROGEN CHLORIDE 4 MO. FEE $ 420.00] ¢ 1,000.00
TECHNICAL SIZE Y 600 LB. CYL MO. TOTALFEE $ 1,680.00] $ 4,000.00
CYLINDER YRLY RENTAL FEE $ 20,160.00f $ 48,000.00
ITEM2 TOTAL $ 20,160.00] $ 48,000.00 NO BID
3 CYL HAZMAT FREIGHT PICK- 8 UNIT $ 10.00] $ 250.00
UP CHARGE CYL ITEM3TOTAL $ 80.00] $ 2,000.00 NO BID
4 CYL. HAZMAT FREIGHT 8 UNIT $ 25.00| $ 500.00
DELIVERY CHARGE CYL ITEM 4 TOTAL $ 200.00f $ 4,000.00 NO BID
TOTAL BID (ITEMS 1-4) $ 87,940.00 | $ 134,000.00 NO BID
RESIDENT BIDDER| NONRESIDENT BIDDER
DISCOUNT: 0.00%
PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS




